
City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

August 25, 2021
Annual Contract for Veterinary and Pharmaceutical 
Supplies for Animal Care Services

Item Number Description No./Unit
Estimated 

Annual 
Quantity Part Number Unit Price

Unit of 
Measure

Quantity per 
Unit of 

Measure Total Part Number Unit Price Unit of Measure

Quantity per 
Unit of 

Measure Total
WITHDREW

Section 1 - Specified Items

Items 1 - 67 DELETED

68 DOLOREX INJ 10mg/mL, 50mL each 100 017070 $179.93 EACH 1 $17,993.00

Items 69 - 94 DELETED

95 GENTAMICIN OPHTH SOL 0.3% 5ML each 204 055134 $121.30 EACH 10 $2,474.52

Items 96 - 112 DELETED

113 IVERHART MAX SOFT CHEWS FOR DOGS 6-12lbs, 
PURPLE LABEL, 10x6-CT

box 150 392869 $160.50 BOX 30 $24,075.00

114 IVERHART MAX SOFT CHEWS FOR DOGS 12.1-
25lbs, BLUE LABEL, 10x6-CT

box 150 363306 $165.65 BOX 30 $24,847.50

115 IVERHART MAX SOFT CHEWS FOR DOGS 25.1-
50lbs, GREEN LABEL, 10x6-CT

box 150 348483 $201.95 BOX 30 $30,292.50

116 IVERHART MAX SOFT CHEWS FOR DOGS 50.1-
100lbs, BROWN LABEL, 10x6-CT

box 150 384603 $243.35 BOX 30 $36,502.50

Items 117 - 140 DELETED

141 MOMETAMAX OTIC SUSP 12x7.5gm 12-CT box 13 185393 $169.92 BOX 12 $2,208.96

Items 142 - 155 DELETED

156 PANACUR SUSPENSION 1000ML each 16 069267 $127.34 EACH 1 $2,037.44

Items 157 - 215 DELETED

216 VETSULIN INSULIN U40 10ml each 3 127260 $33.90 EACH 1 $101.70

Items 217 - 224 DELETED

Total Specified Items $140,533.12

Section 2 - Catalog, Published Price Lists

1 DELETED

Payment Terms Net 30

Estimated Annual Total $140,533.12

Estimated Annual Award $140,533.12 Withdrew

Deleted Items:  Section 1 - 1 - 67, 69-94, 96 - 112, 117 - 140, 142 - 155, 157 - 215 and 217 - 224 will be re-bid at a later date
Deleted Items:  Section 2 will be re-bid at a later date

Non-Local Non-Local
Intervet Inc. dba Merck Animal Health
2000 Galloping Hill Rd.
Kenilworth,
NJ  07033
800-521-5767

Midwest Veterinary Supply Inc.
21467 Holyoke Ave
Lakeville,
MN  55044
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Part Number Unit Price
Unit of 

Measure

Quantity per 
Unit of 

Measure Total Part Number Unit Price
Unit of 

Measure

Quantity per 
Unit of 

Measure Total
NAS NAS

17070 $179.93 1 50ml $17,993.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2421 $2.18 1 5ml $444.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

50102 $197.36 1 10x6DS $29,604.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

50104 $197.39 1 10x6DS $29,608.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

50106 $241.86 1 10x6DS $36,279.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

50108 $285.50 1 10x6DS $42,825.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

185393 $169.92 1 12x7.5G $2,208.96 21294617 $9.09 1 7.5GM $118.17

69267 $127.34 1 1000ml $2,037.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

127260 $33.90 1 10ml $101.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

$161,102.32 $118.17

Net 30 Net 30

$161,102.32 $118.17

Non-Local
Alternate
Non-Local

Patterson Vet Supply
822 7th Street, Ste 740
Greeley,
CO  80632-1240

Patterson Vet Supply
822 7th Street, Ste 740
Greeley,
CO  80632-1240


	FINAL

